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Actual Procurement Activity ABC {PHP) Contract Cost {PhP) List of Invited Observers :?:;l::o R"ecelpt of
‘cs/c:::) PR Procurement Program/Profect PMO / End-User P M:::r:f ¢ ads, Post Qusl/BAC Reso Source of Funds Bid Evaluation {results Befivery/ {Explaining c::::u:k:mm the APP)
TOC! e of Com
No. Pre-Proc Canfsranco m{:": i é PrabidCont |  Ellgibility Check Nﬁg’s&:ﬂﬂ Bid Evatustion .|  Recommending Netics to Procaed c?:;’;’;jn psction s Total MOOE o Total MOOE Pra-bid Cont Efigibilhy Chack subjopenotais | PremTadiode - Bostusi e :::{d wﬁ“:;v
et Mesting) (i applicable)
APLETED PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES
Supply of Quantiferon {QFT) T8 . 184-2020105000 COA Representative/
NIH-ICHHD -Apr- -Apr- . 5 . - - X LAUg- -AD- » - X - = -Dec-
13033 Collection Tubes and T8 Elisa Kit H Public Bidding 05-Apr-21 08-Apr-21 19/04/2021 | 03/05/2021 | 03-May-21 | 11-May-21 | 24-May-21 12-Aug-21 (416) 107-404- |  3,240,000.00 3,240,000.00 2,960,000.00 2,960,000.00 AUPWU 15-Apr-21 23-Nov-20 23-Nov-20 24-Nov-20 07-Dec-20
43
Supply of Equipment for the Project
“SAILS” Port and Ballast Water Negotiated 14-Sep-21 922,378.00
Baselines Using Ecological Scle?\tlﬂc and 03-Aug-21 $50,000.00 )
12249 Microblological and eDNA NIH-RGAO (CAS, Other Services 03-May-21 11-May-21 N/A 10-May-21 | 10-May-21 | 25-May-21 31-May-21 13-Sep-21 2 02';11304;000 4,292,881.00 4,292,881.00 4,059,392.20 1,372,502.00 COA “;’Upwu ve/ Nfa 17-May-21 17-May-21 27-May-21 27-May-21
Approaches (Autoclave, Blosafety (53.8) 19-Aug21 ) 1,018,511,20
Cabinet Class i, Cabinet-type
incybator...) 03-Aug-21 96,000.00
Supply of Equipment for the Project ; "
02-Aug-21 373,200.00
SAILS Port and Ballast Water Direct F184- il COA Representative/
12176 NiH-RGAO (CAS, 05-Mar- - - - N - . X . - E - . - 8 -
Baselines Using Ecologlcal (CAs) Contracting ar-21 04-May-21 N/A 10-May-21 | 10-May-21 | 19-May-21 24-May-21 2020105000 4,593,440.00 4,593,440.00 4,593,200.00 AUPWU N/A 17-May-21 17-May-21 20-May-21 20-May-21
. 03-Aug-21 2,220,000.00
Microbiological and eDNA
Supply of Planetary Book Scanner UPM-UL Public 8idding 15-Mar-21 22-Mar-21 29-Mar-21 12-Apr-21 12-Apr-21 FAILED PR-Ubrary-21-02 £1,650,000,00 1,650,000.00 25-Mar-21 08-Apr-21 08-Apr-21
13175 D COA Representative/
Supply of Planetary Book Scanner AUPWU
(Rebid) 26-un-21 05-Jul-21 19-jul-21 194ul21 | 27-Jul-21 09-Aug-21 24-Sep-21 £1,648,000.00 1,648,000.00 25-jun-21 01-jul-21 15-jul-21 23-Jul-21 05-Aug-21
Supply of Flow Cytometer for the
Project entitled Port Ballast Water Negotiated F1B4- AR ]
13220 Baselines usung Ecologlcal CAS (RGAO) | scientific and 24-May-21 25-May-21 N/A 07-un-21 | 074un-21 | 11-un21 | 21-fun-21 31-Aug-21 2020105000 |  4,330,000.00 4,330,000.00 4,230,000,00 4,230,000.00 © epre\‘;"“' ve/ N/A 03-Jun-21 03-jun-21 11-Jun-21 11-Jun-21
Microbiological and eDNA Other Services {416) 107111 AUPWU
Annraache
Renewal CISCO Smart NET Plan Direct COA Representative/
iMs 15-Mar- -Jun- Jun- -fun- -Sap- RE o -Jun- -Jun- - Jun-;
13484 (Warranty/Service/Maintenance) Contracting ar-21 N/A NfA 07-Jun-21 07-Jun-21 N/A 21-jun-21 14-Sep-21 PR-RF-2021-057 1,203,042.66 1,203,042.66 1,182,383.67 1,182,383.67 AUPWU N/A 14-jun-21 14-jun-21 N/A 17-Jun-21
] No proposal
Supply of One {1) Year Subscription
) 24-May-21 25-May-21 N/A received -
to ACS Web Journal Al Publications Direct " -03- }
13350 UPM-UL co FAILED PRALab-21-03 | 141,000.00 1,141,000.00 COA Representative/
ntracting 16 AUPWU
Supply of One (1) Year Subscription 15-un-21 N/A N/A 21-un-21 N/A 05-lul-2 01-Sep-21 1,141,000.00 1,141,000.00 N/A 28-un-2 28-un-21 N/A 01-Jul-21
to ACS Web Journal All Publications un- -lul-21 ~>ep- [t (el /) -Jun-21 ~Jun
Supply of Saliva Collection Kit for the 14-June-21 £184-~
. 15-Mar-21 17-Mar-21 29-Mar-21 12-Apr-21 -Apr- N -Mar- -Apr- -Apr- FAILED FAILED
13032 Study "Long -Term Qutcomes of | i ieuup | pyblic Bidding l P AP | (raitep) m 2020105000 | 4 oo o 1 680.000.00 COARepresentativey| 1o Mer2 08-Apr-21 OB-Apr-21
Supply of saliva Collection Kit for the 02-Aug-2l | 0S-Aug21 | 23-Aug-21 | 23-Aug2i | 01-Oct21 |  25-Oct-21 24-Nov-21 (416) 107-46a- | T B 1,352,560.00 1,352,560.00 AUPWU 5-Aug-21 19-Aug-21 19-Aug-21 N/A 21-0ct-21 Delayed submission of Technical
Study "Long -Term Qutcomes of e € € “Aug- o © oV ¥3 1EOEIIT mEEE 05-Aug- -Aug- -Aug- EvaluationReport from the end-user.
Supply of Nitrogen Generator for . ¥ 2040101000 ~ COA Representative/
NIH-HG -Mar- -Mar- -Mar- -Apr- -Apr- bl -Sul- -Oct-" -ADT~ -ADI-. -ADr- -lul- -Jul-
13021 the Newborn Screening Center Public Bidding i5-Mar-21 22-Mar-21 29-Mar-21 12-Apr-21 12-Apr-21 15-Jul-21 26-3ul-21 14-0Oct-21 16142 2,352,000.00 2,352,000.00 2,350,000.00 2,350,000.00 AUPWU 05-Apr-21 09-Apr-21 09-Apr-21 22-lul-21 22-Jul-21
21-Oct-21 800,000.00
Supply of Laboratory Equipment for 28/06/2021
the Project Establishment of the 14-Oct-21 F184- 461,500.00 COA Representative/
13454 ) N CP (RGAO) Public Biddin 31-May-21 03-Jun-21 14-lun-21 28-jun-21 -Jun- -Aug- A X P! -Jun- -jun- -jun- 5.Jul-2. 26-Aug-21
Unlversity of the Philippines Manifa 8 Y- un Note: 8id by 30-Jun-21 31-Aug-21 08-0ct21 2030101000 20,180,566.78 20,180,566.78 19,510,250.00 9,536,000,00 AUPWU 10-bun-21 25-jun-21 05-jun-21 s} 1 33
Drugs of Abuse Research Laboratory item (421-188-6-Y2)
18-Oct-21 8,300,000.00
13-Oct-21 412,750.00
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Supply of Drager Alcotest 6820 Negotiated 184~ "
12656 Alcohiot Breath Analyzer and fOH (RGAQ) | Scientific and 26-Apr-21 28-Apr-21 N/A 03-May-21 03-May-21 07-May-21 | 10-May-21 12-4ui-21 020105000(416]  1,200,000.00 1,200,000.00 1,200,000.00 1,200,000.00 COA Representative/ N/A 20-Apr-21 20-Apr-21 07-May-21 | O07-May-21
Accessorles Other Services )107:96 AUPWU
2021
Printing of Newborn Hearing 28/06/2021 17 June
sereening Registry Stickers 17-May-21 0d-fun-21 W21 | D FAILED 10-un-21 (no bid received)
12851 NIH-NHSRC | Public Bidding 2040101000 3.000,000.00 3.000,000.00 COA Representative/
Printing of Newborn Hearing 17-May-21 N 22 | 161A (TF184) o o AUPWU
Screening Reglstry Stickers {REBID) 2y -l ~ul-21 26-jul-21 26-hut-21 11-Aug-21 23-Aug-21 23-5ep-21 2,040,800.00 2,040,000.00 08-Jul-21 22-4ul-21 22-4ub-21 12-Aug-21
Supply of Reference Standard: rvn
13315 Laboratory Supplles for the Project CP (RGAO) Public Bidding 31-May-21 08-lun-21 14-jun-21 28-Jun-21 28-Jun-21 12-Jul-21 15-jut-21 09-Sep-21 2030105000 1,000,000.00 1,000,000.00 998,000.00 998,000.00 COA Representative 21-Jun-21 05-Jul-21 05-Jul-21 19-1ul-21 22-Jul-21
“Establishment of the University of 421-188-6.¥2) JAUPWU
Supply of Neo-base Non-Derlvatized  (421-188 -
12892 Assay Solutlons Reagents Usefor |  NIH-HG | PublicBidding |  01-Mar-21 05-Mar-21 | 15-Mar-21 29-Mar-21 29-Mar-21 07-Apr-21 | 03-May-21 27-4ul-21 240101000-180-1  4,702,500.00 4,702,500.00 4,702,500.00 4,702,500.00 COA Reprasemtative/ | g 1y 5 05-Apr-21 05-Apr-21 12-Apr-21 10-May-21
MSMS Assay Chtaide TOEITE Ghid ’ AUPWU
$53!
Supply of Newborn Screening Blood -
12861 Coltection Card with Customized NIH-HG Public Bidding 15-feb-21 18-Feb-21 01-Mar-21 15-Mar-21 15-Mar-21 12-Apr-21 19-Apr-21 21-Jun-21 240101000-184-1¢ 15,000,000,00 15,000,000.00 14,625,000.00 14,625,000.00 COA Represemtative/ 22-Feb-21 22-Mar-21 22-Mar-21 19-Apr-21 26-Apr-21
Printed Form AUPWU
Supply of Kit for
Hemogloblnopathies and | COA Represemtative/
12108 Thatasserta on Drled Blood Spat NiH-IHG Public Bldding 03-Nov-20 06-Nov-20 16-Nov-20 01-Dec-20 01-Dec-20 14-Dec-20 22-Dec-20 23-Feb-21 420101000-184-14  36,575,000.00 36,575,000.00 36,575,000.00 36,575,000.00 AUPWU 23-Nov-20 07-Dec-20 07-Dec-20 21-Dec-20 28-Dec-20
Variant nbs Sickle Cell Program
Supply of Glutaric Acidurla Type 1 ‘
13599 Medical Foods for Clinical Genetic |  NIHAHG | PublicBidding |  31-May-21 11un-21 21-un-21 05-ul-21 05-ul-21 12-ul-21 19-0u1-21 07-5ep-21 2040101000-188) 503 67 263 00 33,067,392.00 $23,352,480.00 23,352,480.00 CoA R;ﬁ:xgmwe/ 17-Jun-21 30-un-21 30-jun-21 08-ul-21 15-jui-21
Unit 142 !
Supply of Maple Syrup Urine -
13597 Disease Medical Foods for Clinical | NIH-IHG | Public Bidding 31-May-21 11-lun-21 21-un-21 05-jul-21 05-Jul-21 120121 19-4ui-21 22:8ep-21 2040101000-184) o 1< 20 240.00 45,362,240.00 $37,167,200.00 37,167,200.00 coA Ri‘ﬁ:m“""e/ 17-Jun-21 30-fun-21 30-un-21 08-Jul-21 15-ul-21
Genetles Unit 142 [ !
Supply of Protein Free- High Energy
13600 Medical Foods for Protein NIH-IHG Public Bidding 31-May-21 11-jun-21 21-jun-21 05-Jul-21 05-1ul-21 12-4ul-21 19-jut-21 07-Sep-21 2040101000-184 o1 2cc,804.00 18,255,804.00 $15,229,800.00 15,229,800,00 COA Representative/ -2t 30-un-21 30-Jun-21 08-Jul-21 15-4ul-21
Metabolism Disorder for Clinjcal 142 AUPWU
Supply of Protein and Fatty Acid
13598 Metabofism Disorders Medical NIHHG | PublicBidding |  31-May-21 Whun2t | 20-4un-21 05-jul-21 05-Jul-21 12-4ut-21 19-Jul-21 22-5ep-21 202040101000 | ¢ 27 5800 35,367,528.00 $28,753,320.00 28,753,320.00 COA Representative/ 17-1un-21 30-Jun-21 30-Jun-21 08-Jut-21 15-Jul-21
Foods for Cinfcal Genetics Unit 184-142 AUPWU
Reconneding on Canvas with UP Nego: Scholarly
13843 (27) support, Convas Cloud OVEAM | and Academic O-Jun-21 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 21-Jun-21 N/A PR-RF-21-063 |  #6,166,800.00 £5,010,163.28 6,010,163.28 N/A N/A N/A N/A 28-un-21
)| ar
Negotiated 03-Nov-21
the "PhilDiamond Project 1: ov- $65,875.00 COA Re
M Sy e ol o Ao presentative/ hl ke g San.
Biomarkers of Immune Dysfunction | ' ("oA0) Procurement | 28und /A Nya 05-4ul-21 05-Jul-21 OG-Aug-21 | 31-Aug2 290ct21 £1,101,405.00 $885,250.00 AUPWU N/A 01-1ul-21 01-4ul-21 05-pug-2l | 07-Sep2i
In HIV.-A d Metahallc and sk 16-Dec-21 #150,280.00
12-Nov-21 £102,400.00
11-Nov-21 £260,000.00
Supply of Laboratory Supplies for
the "PhilDiamond Project 1:
Biomarkers of Immune Dysfunction Negotiated
- RV Assoclated Metaboicand | €M (RGAO) Pr::ur:ran:nt 28-Jun-21 N/A N/A 31-Aug-21 31-Aug-21 09-Sep-21 | 27-Sep-21 11-Nov-21 F184- #2,267,895.50 £1,766,696.00
Neurocognitive Complication €. 33 2020105000 £4,142,301.46 4,142,301.46
(Remnalning items) (416) 107-138
16-Nov-21 19,112.50
10-Nov-21 119,687.00
| SUBPIY ST TE0Or ATy SUPpIEsTorT
the "PhilDiamond Project 1: 16-Dec-21 4,100.00
Biomarkers of immune Dysfunction Negotiated :
in HIV-Assoctated Metabolicand | O WCAC) P';"':;":"‘ &-dun-21 N/A 11-0ct-21 11-0ct-21 26-0ct:21 | 02Nov-21 17-Dec-21 $209,353.00 124,403.00
Neurocognitive Complication < 93 .
« ftocas.. 3l 18-Dec-21 80,850.00
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27/07/2021 27/07/2021
14-Jun-21 05-Jul-21 12-Jul-21 22/07/2021
NO BID RECEIVED | NO BID RECEIVED 08-jul-21 R gy RecevED
Supply of Diterln (Sapropterin
Dihydrothliride) Local Custom 23/08/2021 23/08/2021 19/08/2021
352 t NIH-IH i -Aug- -Aug- - 3
13527 Duties and Taxes Documentations G Public Bldding REBID 03-Aug-21 03-Aug-21 LONE BID LONE BID 2040101000 $1,953,750,00 COA REPRESENTATIVE/ 01-Aug-21 19-Aug-21 LONE BID NON
and Delivery Fees and Local Bank DISQUALIFIED DISQUALIFIED 184-142 AUPWU COMPLANT
Charges for Clinical Genetics Unit
REBID $39,075.00 | $39,075.00
30-Aug-21 06-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 04-Oct-21 11-Oct-21 01-Dec-21 £1,770,650.00 $35,413.00 02-Sep-21 16-5ep-21 16-5ep-21 01-Oct-21 07-Oct-21
27/07/2021 27/07/2021 19/08/2021
14-Jun-21 05-jul-21 12-hul-
2L | MO BIDRECEIVED | NO BID RECEIVED 08-Jul-21 22-ul-21 LONE BID NON
COMPLIANT
ical St
13656 Supplfi ::: ::‘rgﬁ; 2’:::: » :lzplles NIH-HG Public Bldding 23/08/2021 23/08/2021 2040101000- $90,285.00 COA REPRESENTATIVE/
REBID 03-Aug-21 09-Aug-21 LONE 8iD LONE BID 184-142 {$90,295,00)*50 ’ AUPWU 01-Aug-21 19-Aug-21 16-Sep-21 01-0ct-21 07-0ct-21
DISQUALIFIED DISQUALIFIED
REBID 30-Aug-21 06-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 04-Oct-21 11-Oct-21 01-Dec-21 $4,224,600.00 $84,492.00 02-Sep-21 16-Sep-21 16-Sep-21 01-Oct-21 07 Oct 22021
Supply of Ultra Low Freezer for the
Project 1 "Next Generation F184-
60 CM{RG i -Jun- -jul- -Jul- -ful- -hul-
135 Sequencing - Based Expression M (RGAO} | PublicBidding 14-jun-21 03-Jul-21 12-jut-21 27-ful-21 27-hul-21 18-Aug-21 31-Aug-21 11-Oct-21 2020105000 #1,300,000.00 £1,300,000.00 $938,500.00 $938,500.00 coa RE;Z?;%TATWE/ 08-Jul-21 22-4ul-21 22-hul-21 23-Aug-21 26-Aug-21
Profiling of Breast Cancer Amang {416) 107-139
Supply of Neobase Non-Derivatized
13854 Assay Solutions and Defffainducer | NIHAHG | PublicBidding 14-Jun-21 03-jul-21 12-3ul-21 27-4ul-21 2721 04-Aug21 |  16-Aug-21 09-Nov-21 2040101000-1841 o, 108 95 00 4,108,752.00 £4,108,752.00 4,108,752.00 COAREPRESENTATIVE/ | g1, 5 22-jul-21 22-ul-21 05-Aug-21 12-Aug-21
for Ciinlcal Genetics Unit 142 AUPWU
08-Oct-21 2,300,000.00
o - . - - . L ,300,000.
Supply of Laboratory Equipment for (RGAO} | Public Bidding 28-jun-21 06-Jul-21 12-Jul-21 27-hul-21 27-Jui-21 12-Aug-21 31-Aug-21 #38,300,000.00 08-Jul-21 22-hul-21 22-ul-22 08-Aug-21 26-Aug-21
08-Oct-21 36,000,000.00
the "PHiIDiamond Project 1 2020105000 ptthihe
13611 Biomarkers of Immune Dysfunction 06-Dec-21 (416) 107-138 $40,703,000.00 40,703,000.00 66,900.00 COA REPRESENTATIVE/
in HIV -Assoclated Metabolic and REBID (REMAINING 05-Dec-21 DOST 508.500.00 AUPWU
Cl i . - - . 3
Neurocognitive Complication M (RGAO} | Public Bldding Tems) 13-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 04-Oct-21 04-Oct-21 11-Oct-21 02-Nov-21 $1,133,460.00 , 16-5ep-21 10.5ep-21 305ep-21 18-06-21 28.0ct-21
06-Dec-21 308,000.00
07-Dec-21 250,000.00
Supply of Laboratory Equipment for CAS (RGAQ! . -~ 08-Oct-21 170,400.00
PhilDiamond Project 3: { )] Publlc Bldding 28-Jun-21 07-jul-21 12-ui-21 27-jul-21 27-Jul-21 12-Aug-21 23-Aug-21 £1,231,400.00 08-Jul-21 23-4ul-21 22ul21 12-Aug-21 15-Aug-21
Development of a Safe Lactic Acid 08-Oct-21 2020105000 1,061,000.00 .
13563 Bacteria (LAB) Based Biofunctionat {416) 107-136 #7,875,000.00 7,975,000.00 CoA R:r:]r:swentatwe/
Health Promoting Product as an CAS (RGAO Nego: Two Falted 21-Dec-21 BOsT 1,489,000.00
Adjunt Intervention ( ) Bldding N/A 27-Sep-21 04-Oct-21 18-Oct-21 18-Oct-21 28-Oct-21 08-Nov-21 $5,002,813.00 30-Sep-21 14-Oct-21 14-Oct-21 28-Oct-21 04-Nov-21
21-Dec-21 3,513,913.00
Supply of Thirteen (13) Desktop
12563 Computer for (:J::/:orn Screentng NiH-HG Public Bidding 28-jun-21 13-Jul-21 18-jul-21 02-Aug-21 02-Aug-21 05-Aug-21 13-5ep-21 11-Nov-21 184-142 $1,300,000.00 1,300,000.00 £1,262,642.94 $1,262,642.94 oA RE:Z?::JTATNE/ 15-jul-21 29-jul-21 29-jul-21 05-Aug-21 08-5ep-21
UPEY STiviGIT ASCITTETOT TTE
Study "Long-Term Gutcomes of F184-
1C) -Jun- <Jul -Jul-; -Aug- .. 5
13339 Fiagnosed TB Cases in the NIH-ICHHD | Public Bidding 28-Jun-21 13-jul-21 19-4ul-21 02-Aug-21 02-Aug-21 05-Aug-21 |  16-Aug-21 11-0ct-21 2020105000 $3,500,000.00 3,500,000.00 $3,500,000.00 3,500,000.00 coa RE:E%:VEVTM'VE/ 15-Jul-21 29-hul-21 20-Jul-21 12-Aug-21 12-Aug-21
iliemlonet Va2 b2 DOST
Supply of Conventional Cage 30
Rack for the Project Cessation of F184-
13302 Toluene Addiction in Adolescents H-imMBB Public Bldding 28-Jun-21 17-jul-21 27-jul-21 09-Aug-21 09-Aug-21 12-Aug-21 17-Aug-21 13-Oct-21 2020105000 £3,000,000.00 3,000,000.00 $2,880,000.00 2,860,000.00 oA RE;ZE:;'LTM'VE/ 22-Jul-21 02-Aug-21 02-Aug-21 12-Aug-21 15-Aug-21
Using 2 Rodent Model to Test Novel {416) DOST
Supply of Equipment for the Project
“Seroprevalence of Human Nego: Emergency F184-
P! -Jun- -Jul- -Jul-
13736 Adenovirus § Neutralizing CPH (RGAO) Cases Bedure2d 17121 n/A 26-4ul-21 26-ul-21 1-Aug2l | 2Aug2l 08-0ct-21 2020105000 |  $1,736450.00 1,736,450.00 $1,736,450.00 1,735,450.00 CoA “E';?J?&'ff”‘“/ /A 2221 220021 19-aug2t | 27-Augn please verify dates

Anttbodies in an Adult Population

(416) 107-143
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Supply of Custornized CPP Chamber .
. Nego: Scientific F184-
for the Project Cessation of Toluene 05/07/2021 COA REPRESENTATIVE/ {$36,800.00)
NiH-IMBB -ful- ~Aug- bl -Jul- -Sep- -Oct-: . ,998,561. . ,855,456, -Aug- -AUE-: -Aug- -Sep- ! 36,800.00) P1,855,456.00
13899 Addiction In Adolescents: Using a as& O‘t:;r {no bid received) 15-tul-21 N/A 11-Aug-21 27-jul-21 23-Jul-21 06-5ep-21 19-Oct-21 :g;o;g?og)o ?1,998,561.60 1,998,561.60 P1,855,456.00 P1,855,456.00 AUPWU N/A 06-Aug-21 22-Aug-21 27-Aug-21 01-5ep-21 P1,855,456.00 {$ )P,
Rodent Model ta Test Novel e (418) 107-
upply of Various Laboratory 15-Nov-21 T84-7020165660 1,948,814.00 COA REPRESENTATIVE/
13845 Equipment for the Project Entitted CM {RGAQ) Public Bidding 02-Aug-21 07-Aug-21 16-Aug-21 31-Aug-21 31-Aug-21 08-5ep-21 20-Sep-21 15-Nov-21 {416-3107-133) £3,451,300.00 $3,451,300.00 $3,247,114.00 648,300.00 AUPWU 11-Aug-21 27-Aug-21 27-Aug-21 08-Sep-21 15-5ep-21
"OR PETALS: Operating Room 12-Nov-21 107 650,000.00
Supply of Varlous Office / IT CM{RGAO) | Public Bidding 02-Aug-21 10-Aug-21 t6-augy | OrAve202l 31 Aug 2021 11-Aug-21 27/08/2021 27/08/2024 FAILED (No Bidder)
Equipment for the Project Entitted {no bid received} {no bid received) A REPRES . {no bid recejved) | {No bid opened)
13844 "OR PETALS: Operating Room 1?:;?;21?;0:?:0 $1,720,000.00 1,720,000.00 co AU PVEV?JTAT Ve/
Programmable Electronically " : REBID "
CM {RGADQ)] Public Biddir B 13-Sep-21 20-5ep-21 04-Oct-21 04-Oct-21 - 5. 3 -Dec- $1,664,160.00 1,664,160.00 16-Sep-21 30-Sep-21 30-5ep-21 14-Oct-21 21-Oct-21
Targeted Active Lighting { ) 2 {Remaining Itemns) i P 2 12-Oct-21 25-0ct-21 06-Dec-21 g i P P
Supply of Office Equipment for the
14508 Project: "Solidarity Trial Vaccine in | CM {RGAO) Public Bidding 09-Aug-21 13-Aug-21 23-Aug-21 06-Sep-21 06-Sep-21 15-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 10-Nov-21 18:_::;?;: JiOaOD $6,292,686.00 6,292,686.00 $1,983,900.00 1,983,900.00 oA RE:Z?;I\LTATWE/ 18-Aug-21 02-Sep-21 02-Sep-21 10-Sep-21 10-Sep-21
the Philippines” {
SUPDIV DT RTY-PUR 0T e Frujety Fi84-
N it of the Gut Microbi Nego:
13563 Assessment of the Gut Microblome | 1 g p ) |Nego: Emergency| 0 o 26-Aug-21 N/A 31-Aug-21 31-Aug-21 09-Sep-21 |  20-Sep-21 24-Nov-21 2040105000 $1,200,000.00 1,200,000.00 $1,020,275.00 1,020,275.00 COA REPRESENTATIVE/ N/A 26-Aug-21 06-Aug-21 09-Sep-21 16-Sep-21
for COVID-19 Dlagnosls and Cases AUPWU
a Lal) {416) 107-131
sappTy T VEABAs GGouratory
Equipment for the Profect NIH-MBB | Public Bidding 09-Aug-21 28-Aug-21 06-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 20/09/2021 FAILED 02-5ep-21 16-Sep-21 16-Sep-21 FAILED FAILED
"Cessation of Toluene (Rugby) {No bid recelved) 184-2020105000 COA REPRESENTATIVE/
14164 Addiction in Adolescents; Using a (4;6) 107-130 $7,723,832.40 7,723,832.40 AURWU
Rodent Model to Test Novel Public Bidding )
H-IMBB -Aug- _Sep- 04-Oct- z g . Nov- Dec- ) , -Aug- -Oct- . Nov- -Nov-
Pharmacolaglcal and Behavioral NI B (Rebid) 09-Aug-21 27-5ep-21 ct-21 18-0ct-21 18-Oct-21 25-0ct-21 08-Nov-21 23-Dec-21 $7,658,740.25 7,658,740,25 30-Aug-21 13-Oct-21 18-Oct-21 04-Nov-21 04-Nov-21
I far o ®
Printing of the Three (3} Volume The SMALL VALUE COA REPRESENTATIVE/
4 IPPAC ~Aug-; -Sep-. -Sep-: -Sep- -Sep-; - Sep- 5 - A 909,750. X , -Sep- -Sep-. -Sep- -Sep-21
14915 Human Spirit Books PROCUREMENT 31-Aug-21 08-Sep-21 13-5ep-21 20-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 22-Sep-21 27-Sep-21 22-Oct-21 UPM - Funds $309,750.00 ] 00 $698,600.00 698,600.00 AUPWU N/A 15-Sep-21 15-5ep-21 23-Sep-21 23-5ep-2
VT COA REPRESENTATIVE/
13822 jupply of Brand New Laptops for TTBD) TT8DO Public Bidding 19-Jul-21 13-Sep-21 20-Sep-21 04-Oct-21 04-Oct-21 26-Oct-21 02-Nov-21 21-Dec-21 PO 2040101000 #1,170,000.00 £1,170,000.00 #973,700.00 $973,700.00 AUPWU
Supply of RT-PCR Test Kit for COVID- F1g4- COA REPRESENTATIVE/
14585 185 {Locally Developad Kit with Field NIH 2g0: Emergency Cas| 13-5ep-21 16-Sep-21 N/A 20-Sep-21 20-5ep-21 24-Sep-21 N/A 28-Nov-21 2040105000 $20,000,000.00 £20,000,000.00 $£20,000,000.00 $20,000,000.00
AUPWU
Valldation, FDA Approved) (417) 106
02/11/2021 02/11/2021 28 Oct 2021 08 Oct 2021
Public Blddh 04-Oct-21 11 -, ct-21 8-Oct- FAILED FAILED (No bidder’
usie "8 “Oet-23 180 {No bid received) {No bid received) FAILED 18-0ct-21 {No bid received) | {No bid received) { !
Supply of Information and
Communication Technology for the
14295 Project "Project 1: Science -Based |  NIH-CRC  |ublic Bidding (Rebld  04-Oct-21 08Nov-21 | 1s-Nov-2y | 29/11/2021 29/13/2021 zmtgigf;"m $1,048,500.00 $1,048,500.00 coa R:‘L’:;‘;;m’“/ 22-Nov-21 z5/11/2021 N25b" §1/2°i21d FAILED FAILED {No bidder)
Clincal Research Hub Management (RO BID RECEIVED) (No bid recelved) (NOBDRECEVED) | (Mo bld receivad)
Practices Negotiated
Procurement Two REBID 06-Dec-21 N/A 13-Dec-21 13-Dec-21 17-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 22-Dec-21 $297,830.00 $297,830.00 N/A 09-Dec-21 09-Dec-21 17-Dec-21 17-Dec-21
Failed Biddings
SUBPIY Of L3567 atory EGUIPMENt 107
b"‘e P“’J“‘d Ec":“"d '5'9°’E ’ 15-0ct-21 N/A 25-0ct-21 25-0ct-21 13-Dec-21 o £491,444.00 . y N/A 20-0ct-21 20-0ct-21
Fabrication and Characterizatio of Nego: Sclentific & 184-2020105000 COA Representative,
13860 CM {RGAD, 20-5ep-. -Nov-. -Nov- $1,973,248.28 $1,973,248.28 ,969,620. 1-Nov-2 11-Nov-21
UV nd Hydrogen Peroxide l{ ) Other Sarvices ep-21 08-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 (416} 107-149 ,973,248.2 ,973,248.2 $1,969,620.00 AUPWU 11-Nov-21 ov-
Vaporization for Disinfection of N95 26-Oct-21 N/A 02-Nov-21 02-Nov-21 20-Dec-21 £1,478,176.00 N/A 28-Oct-21 28-Oct-21
v
Supply of Equipment for the entitled F184
" s fon of : .
14680 F°’"‘::Z‘C‘:{:::|dy di::f::::fm" ol cpirano) | Nese: mergeney | oa.cce2t 18-0ct-21 N/A 18-0ct-21 18-0ct-21 26:0ct-21 | 02-Nov-21 06-Dec-21 2020105000 |  $2,235,000.00 #2,235,000.00 £2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 COA R:'U:::G‘a“"e/ N/A 13-0ct-21 13-0ct-21 28-0ct-21 28-0ct-21
Methylprednisalone Sodlum (416} 156
upply of Various Medical
Equipment for the Project "Project . 2040101000-219 COA REPRESENTATIVE/
4948 NIH-CRC Public Bidd -Nov- Nov- -Nov- -Dec- -Dec- -Dec- -Dec- -Dec- 5, 895,515, 493,000 ,493,000. -Nov- -Dec- 3-Dec- -Dec- Dec-21
1 1: Sclence-Based Clinical Research ublic ing 02-Nov-21 11-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 06-Dec-21 06-Dec-21 16-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 22-Dec-21 (F184) $5,895,515.00 $5,895,515.00 $4,493,000.00 #4,493,000.00 AUPWU 29-Nov-21 13-Dee-21 13-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 27-Dec-
Hub A Bract!




A I B C D E F G H | J K i N T 0 P Q R i [ { U v X Y F4 AA AB AC AD AE
Totaf Alloted Budget of Prod 376,212,591.18
Total Contract Price of Pro ‘aditvites Cond, 331,373,399.14
Total Savings (Total Alloted Budgut -jiote] Contrect Price) | 44,839,192.08
-GOING PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES
Winning supplier did not accept the award; 2
, COA Represemtative/ rounds of rebid/! still not ful
Mar-21 17-Mar-21 N/A 22-Mar-21 22-Mar-21 03-May-21 | 17-May-21 PRLib-21-03-14 715,000.00 715,000.00 AUPWU N/A 29-Mar-21 29-Mar-21 10-May-21 27-May-21 Purchase Request sent back to end-user for
13150 Supply of IT and Office Equipment UPM-UL SMALLVALUE review of ABC and specifications
PROCUREMENT
COA Represemtative/
15-Mar-21 03-Nov-21 N/A 08-Nov-21 08-Nov-21 09-Dec-21 13-Dec-21 PR-UB-21-03-14 715,000.00 715,000.00 41,800.00 41,800.00 AUPWU N/A 15-Nov-20 15-Nov-20 16-Dec-20 20-Dec-20 For pick-up of Notice of Award
Supply of Electrical Parts and F184- COAR tative/
14505 Components for the Project: CM(RGAO) | Public Bidding 09-Aug-21 13-Aug-21 23-Aug-21 06-Sep-21 06-Sep-21 Failed 2040101000 #4,637,000.00 £4,637,000.00 $4,637,000.00 £4,637,000,00 ":&fm ative, 13-Sep-21 13-Sep-21 13-Sep-21 Failed NfA FAILED, No Bidder (PR return to end-user)
“Solidarf}tﬁ Trial Vaccine In the 439-179-13
Pply 0f OTfice Equipiment for the oA R eativel
14508 Project; "Solidarity Trial Vaccine In | CM(RGAQ) | Public Bidding 09-Aug-21 08-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 29-Nov-21 20-Nov-21 Failed 2040101000 #6,292,868.00 £6,292,868.00 #6,292,868.00 6,292,868.00 ‘“f:&iﬁ's ative 24-Nov-21 06-Dec-21 06-Dec-21 Falled N/A FAILED, No Bidder (PR return to end-user)
i Tl 1439:178:13)
PRy ratory bquipment Yor Fund 184
the Project Establishment of the UpP SMALL VALUE ) COA Represemtative/ .
13454 Manila Drugs of Abuse Reasearch cp PROCUREMENT 31-May-21 03-Nov-21 N/A 08-Nov-21 08-Nov-21 25-Nov-21 13-Dec-21 2020101000-416- $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $£97,470.00 $97,470.00 AUPWU N/A 15-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 02-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 For pick-up of Notice of Award
Lah 1 188-642
ah \tem)
X X i
Supply of Various Laboratory $937,8565.00 $937,865.00 PO and NTP for acceptance of the supplier
Equipment for the Project £994,562.32 $994,562.32 PO and NTP for acceptance of the supplier
"Antimicrobial Discovery In Fund 184~ COA Represemtative/
14402 Mangrove Solls of Alabat Isfand, NIH-PS Public Bidding 27-Sep-21 04-Oct-21 11-0ct-21 25-0ct-21 25-0ct-21 03-Nov-2l | 22-Nov-21 26-Jan-22 2020101000 |  $5,150,000.00 £5,150,000.00 $320,000.00 #320,000.00 o PV‘:,'S ative 18-0ct-21 03-Nov-21 03-Nov-21 10-Nov-21 29-Nov-21
Quezon producing Microorganism {416) 107-154
from Mangrove Soils Alabat, Island $404,405.80 P404,405.80 PO and NTP for acceptance of the supplier
Quezon {Year 1)
$690,000.00 $690,000.00 PO and NTP for acceptance of the supplier
Supply of Various Laboratory Fund 184-
Equipment for the Project SMALL VALUE COA Represemtative/ For approval of VCA Samaniego of Notice of
0! NIH-1PS -Sep-; - -Nov- -Nov-, -Dec- -Jan-] 50,000. 0,000.00 374,687, 7. -Nov-; -Nov- -Dec- -
14402 “Antimicrobial Discovery In PROCUREMENT 27-Sep-21 24-Nov-21 N/A 29-Nov-21 29-Nov-21 13-Dec-21 10-Jan-22 (jgz;)ig;?fsoq P50, 00 P65 374,687.50 $374,687.50 AUPWU N/A 29-Nov-21 29-Nov-21 13-Dec-21 10-Jan-22 Awards and BAC Resolution
Man%rove Solls of Alabat Island, ;
“Formulation and fzation of Nego: vl COA Represemtative/
14680 Procaine Hydrochloride- CP(RGAQ) | NOEOTEMEENY | 04 beray 22-Nov-21 N/A 20-Nov-21 29-Nov-21 13-Dec21 | 20-Dec2i 2020105000- $235,000.00 $235,000.00 $235,000.00 $235,000.00 eprasem N/A 06-Dec-21 06-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 27-Dec-21 For pick-up of Notice of Award
Cases AUPWU
Methylprednisolone Sodium {416} 107156
for U
mozp | Supplyoflaptopsforuseof NSRC | o0 Public Bdding | 11-Oct-21 18021 | 25021 | oeNovzl 08-Nov-21 Falled 2000101000184 4 500,000.00 03-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 15:Nov-21 Fatled /A FAILED, No Bidder (PR return to end-user)
Staff During Alternative Work 14213
Alternative Mode! COA Represemtative/
14929 f One Year Renewal Subserlption to U ut Direct Contracting 11-Oct-21 26-0ct-21 N/A 02-Nav-21 02-Nov-21 10-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 PR-LAB-21-08-40 $4,013,100.00 $#4,013,100.00 $4,013,100.00 #4,013,100.00 AUPWU N/A 08-Nov-21 08-Nov-21 17-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 PO and NTP for approval
Supply of Microscope for the Profect F184-
" N COA Reprasemtative/
Cessation of Toluene {Rugby) 18-Oct-21 26-Oct-21 02-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 Eailed 2020105000~ £3,124,793.60 $3,124,793.60 AUPWU 07-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 Failed N/A FAILED, No Bidder
Addiction In Adolescents: Using a {416} 107- 130
13901 Rodent Model to Test Novel NIH-IMBB Public Bidding
Pharmacological and Behavioral F184- COAR tative/ For signat £ BAC Resolution by BAC3
Treatment for Overcoming 18-0ct-21 BNov-21 | 20-Nov-21 13-Dec-21 13-Dec-21 20Dec2t | 10-an-22 202010000- |  $3,124,793.60 #3,124,793.60 #2,787,000.00 2,787,000.00 ot 29-Nov21 13-Dec-21 13-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 10-0an-22 o b Y
Withdrawal and Craving" (416) 107- 130 mbers
Supply of Ultrasound Machine for 184-
the Project "Project 4: Exposure of Alternative Mode: COA Represemtative/
78 CM (RGAQ)] -Oct- -Nov-; -Nov- -Nov-: - - - - 202010 0 £2,100,000.60 $£2,100,000.00 ,100,000. ,000. -Nov-; -Nov-; -Nov- -Dec-.
144 Reproductive Aged Pregnant and { ) Direct Contracting 08-Oct-21 11-Nov-21 N/A 15-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 24-Nov-21 29-Nov-21 18-fan-22 (4161) 110275-2131 $2,100,000.00 $2,100,000.00 AUPWU N/A 22-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 29-Nov-21 06-Dec-21
Non-Pregnant Women to Common
Supply of Equipment for the Nego: Sclentii COA Represemtative/
14251 Operation of Simulation Center fa¥] e:; de;{; i 25-Oct-21 28-0ct-21 02-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 15-Nov-21 26-Nov-21 |  06-Dec-21 GAA 2021 £63,776,000.00 $63,776,000.00 £61,326,000.00 £61,326,000.00 Tufwg 2 09-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 06-Dec-21 13-Dec-21 For signature of BUR
College of Medicine, University of N
Supply of GSP Wash Concentrate. .
20401010080-184/
14732 N ! Kit t NiH-ING Public Bidding 06-Sep-21 13-Sep-21 20-5ep-21 04-Oct-21 04-0ct-21 11-Oct-21 25-0ct-21 10-jan-22 142 $9,870,428.80 £9,870,428.80 £9,870,428.80 $9,870,428.80 oA RT[;?::;:}‘“WE/ 27-Sep-21 11-Oct-21 11-Oct-21 17-Oct-21 03-Nov-21
Succinylacetone Assay Solution for




A B c D E F G H | 1 K N ) P Q R 5 T U v X Y z AA AB AC AD AE
Fi84- COA Represemtative/
13284 Supply of Ultra Low Freezer NIH-ICHHD | Public Bidding 07-Jun-21 11-Jun-21 21-Jun-21 05-Jul-21 05-jul-21 23-Nov-21 |  21-Dec-21 04-Jan-22 2020101000{439  1,300,000.00 1,300,000.00 $689,000,00 689,000.00 :wwu 27-Jun-21 120121 12-3ut-21 30-Nov-21 28-Dec-21
)-167€1
14881 Supply of Rack Mounted Server IMS Public Bidding 02-Nov-21 12-Nov-21 22-Nov-21 06-Dec-21 06-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 10-Jan-22 Reprog-21-10-46  PB,000,000.00 $8,000,000.00 P6,648,019.48 P6,648,019.43 coa “2’5:‘;’3"’“”/ 23-Nov-21 11-Dec-21 11-Dec-21 27-Dec-21 17-1an-22 For plck-up of Notice of Award
Direct Contracting Fund
35380 bupply of Alpha Globin Strip=Assay kil NIH-HG Exclusive 13.Dec-21 NA WA 20-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 o7dan22 | 24an22 2040101000 | $2,964,00000 $2,964,000.00 $2,564,000,00 £2,964,000.00 COA Represemtative/ N/A 27-Dec-21 27-Dec21 14-len-22 33an-22 For approval of VCA Samaniego of Natice of
AUPWU Awards and BAC Resolution
Distributorship 184142
Sy OT arory Tov
the "PhilDiamond Project 1! Fi84- )
13611 5 of tmmune Dyst cM{pGaD) | SMALLVALE 284un-21 22-Nov-21 /A 25-Nov-21 29-Nov-21 13.0ec21 | 20-Dec2t 2020105000- #380,000.00 #380,000.00 £348,100.00 £348,100.00 COA Represemtative/ WA 06-Dec-21 06-Dec-21 2Dec2t | 27-Dec2t For approval of VCA Samaniego of Notice of
PROCUREMENT AUPWU Awards and BAC Resolution
in HIV -Assodated Metabolic and (416) 107- 138
SURIY o8 Uis aha Mediaha Ter N
204010 : "
15314 Nitisinone 2mg, Smg and 10mg for | NIH-IHG Public Bidding 22-Nov-21 20-Nov-21 | Of-Dec21 20-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 034an-22 |  24-tan-22 000-184 5 835,500.00 $6,336,500.00 #6,836,500.00 £6,836,500.00 COARepresentative/ 01-Dec-21 15-Dec-21 15-Dec-21 1t-dan-22 31-dan-22 For approval of VCA Samaniego of Natice of
Cllsiesl Ganatice Linits 42 AUPWUY Awards and BAC Resalution
Supply of Server (Secure Storage F184-
Nego: Sclentific COA Represemtative/ BAC Resolution Change Mode of procurement
13561 Data) for the Project 1: Next Y] 4 Other send 22-Nov-21 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 06-Dec-21 2020105000 $1,030,176.00 $1,030,176.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A 13-Dec-21 ‘
AUPWU dding t
Deneration Sequencing -Based o e 416} 107- 142 from Public Bidding to Agency to Agency
FOMI2020- COA Represemtative/ For approval of VCA Samaniego of Notice of
-Dec- -Dec- - - - $2,238,420.00 $2,238,420.00 $2,036,538.04 $2,036,538, 5 % -Jan- -Jan-
Negotiated: 07-Dec-21 NiA 13-Dec-21 13-Dec-2 O04-lan-22 10-4an-22 885(17) e o M 036,538.04 AUPWU W/A 20-Dec-21 -Dec-21 -lan-22 17-lan-22 Awards and BAC Resolution
15021 PE's and Other Supptlies for Retrofitti{ SHS Baaler Ext. Emergency 22-Nov-21
{Ssctlon 53.2) FCME,
07-Dec-21 NA 14-Dec-21 14-Dec-21 oftan-22 | 10-an22 2020- $160,300.00 160,300.00 $30,000.00 930,000.00 COA Represemtative/ NA 27-Dec-21 27-Dec-21 11an22 17-Jan-22 For approval of VCA Samaniego of Notice of
886{17) AUPWU Awards and BAC Resolution
15328 Kits for Hemoglobinopathies and NtH Competitive 25-Now-21 184-142 COA Represemtative/
Thalassemia Dried Blood Spots bidding 06-Dec-21 13-Dec-21 10-Jan-22 10-Jan-22 24-jan-22 $33,250,000.00 $33,250,000.00 $33,250,000.00 $33,250,000.00 AUPWU 20-Dec-21 17-an-22 17-fan-22 31-fan-22 Ongoing Procurement
Variant nbssickle cell oroeram
15474 PCA Plates and Tubes NIH 6 15-Nov-21 Trust Fund 439- 1,391,500.00 1,391,500.00 BAC Resorution for Delegation of End-user
mergency esolution for Detegation of End-user to
N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A -Nov- 173-16 N/A N/A A A -Nov-21
{delegated to / / / / / 22-Nov-21 / ! W N/ 25-Nov. Conduct Procurement
PN
15473 Varlous Laboratory Supplies NIH Negotiated 16-Nov-21 Trust Fund 439- 2,423,610.00 2,423,610.00 BAC Resolution for Delegation of End-user to
N/A N/A -Nov- 5
Emergency /s H/A N/A / N/A 22-Nov-21 179-17 N/A N/A WA WA 25-Nov-21 Conduct Procurement
15472 GenAmplify Kits {rRT-PCR Detection NIH Negotiated 15-Nov-21 TrustFund 439- | 6,171,400.00 6,171,400.00 BAC Resolution for Delegatlon of End-user to
it, Viral RNA Purification Kit 50 Emergency /A N/A N/A N/A N/A 22-Nov-21 179-18 N/A N/A N/A H/A 26-Nov-21 Conduct Procurement
15379 Electronic Data Capture [=0) Negotiated 2080101000-213 o .
{for Proj.1: Sclence-Based Clinlcal {53.6) 29-Nov-21 02-Dec-21 N/A 13-Dec-21 13-Dec-21 16-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 2,000,000.00 2,600,000.00 $1,995,743.30 $1,995,743.30 COA Represemative/ N/A 20-Dec-21 20-Dec-21 23-Dec-21 27-Dec-21 PO and NTP for approval
Research Hub Management AUPWU
COA Represemtative/ 3
06-Dec-21 04-Jan-22 10-Jan-22 24-Jan-22 24-Jan-22 Falled 17-fan-22 31-Jan-22 31-fan-22 Falled Failed, Bidder submit incomplete documents.
Compatitive UPM Fund 184 AUPWU
15153 Dental Chalr and Unit "G ompe {subjto 8OR 4,800,000.00 4,800,000.00
bidding 06-Dec-21 approval) )
31-Jan-22 07-Feb-22 COA Represemtative/ 14-Feb-22 Ongoing Procurement
AUPWU
15316 Varlous Laboratory Reagents for the HG Competitive 13-Dec-21 F184-42 oA fe .
Newborn Screening Center Bidding 04-Jan-22 10-Jan-22 24-Jan-22 24-1an-22 27-Jan-22 $49,704,500.00 P43,704,500.00 $43,704,500.00 $49,704,500.00 :&::"Sm ve/ 17-4an-22 31-Jan-22 3t-Jan-22 03-Feb-22 Ongoing Procurement
15584 GC-MS/MS; GC-MS Triple, Competitive 13-Dec-21 F184.142 15,000,000.00 Ongaing Procurement, Pending walting of revise
Quadrupole GC-MS for Blochemical HG bidding Terms and Conditlons
lah
Supply of Architecturai License FUND & .
15573 Softwares; AutaCAD and CAD-CPomo | VAL VALE 13-Dec-21 14-Dec-21 NA 20-Dee-21 20-Dec-21 3-Dec21 | 24dan-22 184 $2,964,00000 $2,964,000.00 £2,964,000.00 $2,964,000.00 COA Represemtative/ Na 27-Dec21 27-Dec-21 30-Dec21 3t-tan-22 For spproval of VCA Samaniego of Notice of
PROCUREMENT AUPWL Awards and BAC Resolution
Architectural Engineering and 142
Total Alioted Budget of On-gaing Proc Activith 247,203,390.00
Prepared by: Reviewed by: Noted by: Recc ded for Approval by: Approved by:
N
\THLIN- £ T. HIDALGO MILADILLA A, SANTIAGY, MPA E ; TRISTAN N ANIEL C. RAMOS, DDM, MPH ARLENE A, SAMANIEGO, M.D. CARMENCITA D. PADILLA, MD, MAHPS
Director, Procurement Office BAC 3, Chaj Vice Chancellor for Administration Chancellor

BAC 3, Support Staff p‘/
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